From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Missing memo for pretrial settlement
Date: December 27, 2016 4:21:34 PM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>

Date: May 12, 2015 at 12:59:20 PM CDT

To: "<brad@balkelaw.com>" <brad @balkelaw.com>
Subject: Re: Missing memo for pretrial settlement

Hi Brad,

Thanks for the heads up.

My understanding was the 15k bankruptcy protection limit included all my assets, not just the proceeds from this settlement. | was
also informed that | can receive much more than just 15k if the settlement or trial verdict produced enough to satisfy the creditors.

Just so you know...

I won't settle just for the insurance. It isn't enough.

| don't know what a crippled dominate hand/arm is worth but it would seem to me that it is worth a whole lot more than the insurance
limits the defendant has.

Thanks and feel free to call me,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad

On May 12, 2015, at 7:31 AM, Brad Balke <brad @balkelaw.com> wrote:

Paul,

Good news: got a call from Allstate adjuster, Karen O'Neil. She asked me for
some of the documents and photographs. This means she is actually evaluating
for the pre-trial tomorrow. I'm going to call her later today and try to get

the ball rolling.

Also, | reviewed some of the items in the packages you gave me today. Thanks
much for those.

Since you filed for bankruptcy protection, you can only collect $15k from

this case, maximum. (This is the exemption amount under bankruptcy law.) I'm
not saying we can get you to that number, but be aware that is the most you
can possibly collect.

I will call you later today after | have discussed this matter with
Allstate.

Brad

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg @comcast.net]
Sent: Saturday, May 09, 2015 4:33 PM

To: <brad@balkelaw.com>

Subject: Re: Missing memo for pretrial settlement

Hi Brad,
Hope you received 2 packages today
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Paul

On May 8, 2015, at 2:08 PM, Brad Balke <brad @balkelaw.com> wrote:

| will be at Donahue and Walsh (4310 Crystal Lake Drive office) from
9am to 11am tomorrow-can you drop it off?

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net]
Sent: Friday, May 08, 2015 12:34 PM

To: <brad@balkelaw.com>

Subject: Missing memo for pretrial settlement

Hi Brad,

Yesterday Saul Ferris office called and said they just received back
the packet they mistakenly sent to Hans Mast at Popovich law firm.
In it is the pretrial settlement memo you wanted to see.

There is also the printed depositions of both the homeowners, the
defendant and myself.

| picked these up this morning.

Let me know how to get these to you.

Thank you,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad
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