
Date : 7/28/2020 8:20:30 AM
From : "CircuitClerk-MB" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] Digital Records Request for case 17LA000377
 
Case#  17 LA 377

The total cost for your request will be $93.00.  To submit payment, follow the instructions for payment options on 
the link below:

https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/plc/6650

Upon receipt of payment, I will forward the requested documents.

Thank you,
Kim
McHenry County Circuit Clerk’s Office 

-----Original Message-----
From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@me.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 7:49 AM
To: CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Digital Records Request for case 17LA000377

Hello,

I am requesting digital copies of all public records including hearing transcripts for case 17LA000377

I understand there may be fee’s associated with this request and will wait for you to tell me the total amount needed 
and how to go about paying.

Please let me know if there is anything else you need.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter,

Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments 
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common 
spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from pdulberg@me.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.

https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/plc/6650
mailto:pdulberg@me.com

