
Date : 4/1/2021 11:28:22 AM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Stacey Collins" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" , "Alphonse Talarico" 
Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] 17 LA 377
Dear Stacy Collins,

I am looking to request and purchase todays (April 1, 2021) report of proceedings for case 
number 17LA377.

Please advise if you are the correct person I need to reach to initiate this request or please direct 
me to the correct person I should be contacting to initiate this request.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL 60051

On Feb 17, 2021, at 3:56 PM, Stacey Collins 
<SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

The PDF is attached.
 

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 17, 2021 3:54 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] 17 LA 377
 
Dear Stacy Collins, 
 
I have attached a file named Invoice_2020-011_2021-02-17.pdf
 
It is the receipt I received when I paid the invoice.
 
Yes, Please forward the report of proceedings to this email address.
 
Thank You,
Paul
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not 
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the 

content is safe. 

mailto:SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov
mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net
mailto:SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov


While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email 

was actually sent from pdulberg@comcast.net

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the 
helpdesk at extension 4828.

On Feb 17, 2021, at 2:34 PM, Stacey Collins 
<SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:
 
Mr. Dulberg,
 
I have completed the report of proceedings in the above referenced case.  I 
will be sending an invoice in a separate email to you.  Upon receipt of 
payment, I will forward a PDF Report of proceedings to you via this email 
address.
 
 
Stacey A. Collins
Official Court Reporter
22nd Judicial Circuit
Woodstock, IL
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LEGAL CONFIDENTIAL: The information in this e-mail and in any attachment contains 
information which is legally privileged. It is intended only for the attention and use of the 

named recipient. If you are not the intended recipient, you are not authorized to retain, disclose, 
copy or distribute the message and/or any of its attachments. If you received this e-mail in error, 

please notify Stacey A. Collins, CSR, and delete this message.
 
 
 

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2021 2:14 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 17 LA 377
 
This works.
 
I will be using the bank-to-bank payment.
 
Look forward to hearing from you between 2/16-2/19
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https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.google.com_imgres-3Fimgurl-3Dhttp-3A__www.co.mchenry.il.us_departments_circuitclerk_PublishingImages_22Seal.png-26imgrefurl-3Dhttp-3A__www.co.mchenry.il.us_departments_circuitclerk-26usg-3D-5F-5FgsdGw1CXgpbgBnn-5FpRqEAxUzI5w-3D-26h-3D250-26w-3D250-26sz-3D82-26hl-3Den-26start-3D13-26itbs-3D1-26tbnid-3DJX4yH79y7D1FLM-3A-26tbnh-3D111-26tbnw-3D111-26prev-3D_images-253Fq-253Dseal-252Bof-252BMcHenry-252BCounty-2526hl-253Den-2526gbv-253D2-2526tbs-253Disch-3A1&d=DwMFaQ&c=GGUhuO0t3bc1ZFcIaRBQsg&r=XNDo3zyuP74PT46sJE_pu86aQhMLlKasbpFyU4S0gnDFthmNldH3xHE69n96VQgc&m=4icj3ZnMLEld-xLz8MViPMHUUjKD0kGTPzCFwhoDI-s&s=k6yJS2PRi4vM9PySzgMuIk4HT_eRkMb8FVdkpKFs4YY&e=
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Thank you in advance for your help with this matter and hope you enjoy 
your days off,
Paul
 

On Feb 10, 2021, at 2:10 PM, Stacey Collins 
<SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:
 
What I am willing to do is this:
I will have the transcript done for you sometime next week, 
2/16-2/19.
I will waive the deposit process, but payment is due at the time 
the transcript is completed.  I will invoice you with the exact 
amount.  My invoicing allows for payment via ACH (a direct 
bank-to-bank payment).  I do not accept credit cards for 
payment.  You can also send a paper check if you prefer.  Once I 
receive your payment, I will send the report of proceedings to 
you via email.  
 
 
Stacey A. Collins
Official Court Reporter
22nd Judicial Circuit
Woodstock, IL
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LEGAL CONFIDENTIAL: The information in this e-mail and in any 
attachment contains information which is legally privileged. It is intended only 

for the attention and use of the named recipient. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are not authorized to retain, disclose, copy or distribute the 
message and/or any of its attachments. If you received this e-mail in error, 

please notify Stacey A. Collins, CSR, and delete this message.
 
 
 

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2021 2:02 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] 17 LA 377
 
I was given 28 days so as soon as I can. 
 
If your on a short week and have a few days off next week 
that’s okay. I understand the need for time off. 
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When do you think you can have it by and can I pay the 
deposit now so that when you do get to it you have 
everything you need?
 
Thanks,
Paul
 
 

On Feb 10, 2021, at 1:56 PM, Stacey Collins 
<SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> 
wrote:
 
Well, let’s start with the delivery timeframe.  How 
soon would you need delivery of the report of 
proceedings?
 

From: Paul Dulberg 
[mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2021 12:47 PM
To: Stacey Collins 
<SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 17 LA 377
 
Dear Stacy Collins,
 
Yes, I am requesting/inquiring about a report of 
proceedings from February 10, 2021, in the above-
referenced case.

How do I go about paying the $85 deposit needed?
 
Thank You,
Paul
 
Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
pdulberg@comcast.net
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On Feb 10, 2021, at 12:41 PM, 
Stacey Collins 
<SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoisc
ourts.gov> wrote:
 
<ESTIMATED COST OF 
TRANSCRIBED REPORT OF 
PROCEEDINGS.docx>

 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County 
network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 

recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the 
FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. 

For additional reference, this email was actually sent 
frompdulberg@comcast.net

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, 
please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.

 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County 

network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM 
field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional 
reference, this email was actually sent frompdulberg@comcast.net

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please 
call the helpdesk at extension 4828.

 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do 
not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and 

know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field 
are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, 

this email was actually sent frompdulberg@comcast.net

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the 
helpdesk at extension 4828.
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<02 10 21 R201(TAM)__17 LA 377.pdf>


