Date : 9/8/2021 12:03:03 PM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Cristin Kelly"

BCc : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] Request for Report of Proceedings September 7, 2021 Case
17LA377

Attachment : Invoice 20-118_2021-09-08.pdf; ATT00002.bin;

Dear Ms Kelly,
I have attached a pdf of the paid invoice.

Thank you,
Paul




Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR
2200 North Seminary Avenue
Room 355

Woodstock, Illinois 60098
United States

Invoice

BILL TO Invoice Number: 20-118

Paul Dulberg

Paul Dulberg Invoice Date: September 8, 2021

dulberg@icloud Payment Due: September 8, 2021
pdulberg@icloud.com
Amount Due (USD): $0.00

Quantity

17 LA 377, Dulberg vs. Hans Mast, et al.
Report of Proceedings: September 7, 2021

Judge Meyer

Payment on September 8, 2021 using __. ending in 0410:

Amount Due (USD):







On Sep 7, 2021, at 2:26 PM, Cristin Kelly <CMKelly@22ndCircuit.IllinoisCourts.gov> wrote:

Hello, Mr. Dulberg, 
 
I have received your request for the transcript and will get back to you by tomorrow with an estimate and link for payment.
 
Thanks!
Cristin Kelly
 
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 7, 2021 1:03 PM
To: Cristin Kelly <CMKelly@22ndCircuit.IllinoisCourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for Report of Proceedings September 7, 2021 Case 17LA377


 
Dear Ms Kelly,
 

I am requesting and would like to purchase a copy of September 7, 2021 report of proceedings (transcript) for case number 17LA377.

 


A pdf of the transcript will do.


 


Please send a the amount needed and link for payment.


 


Thank you in advance for your help with this matter,


 

Paul

 

Paul Dulberg

pdulberg@icloud.com

pauldulberg@gmail.com

pdulberg@me.com

847-497-4250

4606 Hayden Ct. 

McHenry, IL. 60050



		CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent frompdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.












