Date : 1/10/2022 2:02:38 PM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : jacarlson@?22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

BCc : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: Invoice 145 from Judy Carlson, CSR

Attachment : 2022-01-10_Wave ¢ Judy Carlson, CSR e.pdf; ATT00002.bin;
Please find the attached receipt.

Thank You,
Paul




Wave ¢ Judy Carlson, CSR

lof2

https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1374214...

<chk to Invoice>

Payment Receipt
Invoice #145

for Paul Dulberg
paid on Jan. 10, 2022

Judy Carlson, CSR
2200 North Seminary Avenue
Suite 355
Woodstock, lllinois 60098
United States
Tel: 815-334-4373

Payment for Invoice #145

Payment Amount: $81.38 USD

PAYMENT METHOD: ++++ 0410

1/10/22,2:01 PM



https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1374214839257302068/664A6467472F394537757A73704A514F6676334A4D547245437A6263616C4B

https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1374214839257302068/664A6467472F394537757A73704A514F6676334A4D547245437A6263616C4B



Wave ¢ Judy Carlson, CSR https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1374214...

Thanks for your business. If this invoice was sent in error, please
contact jacarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

2 of 2 1/10/22,2:01 PM



mailto:jacarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

mailto:jacarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv




On Jan 10, 2022, at 1:30 PM, Judy Carlson, CSR <mailer@waveapps.com> wrote:

						[image: ]Judy Carlson, CSR



		

		Invoice for $81.38 due by Jan 10, 2022











								Review & Pay 


















				[image: ]   [image: ]   [image: ]   [image: ]      [image: ]   Bank Payment (ACH)










						I will send you the transcripts upon payment.

















				Invoice 145



		View Invoice


		Judy Carlson, CSR
Phone: 815-334-4373
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