Date : 1/11/2022 1:51:26 PM

From : "Heather Hartwig"

To : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] Re:

Dear Paul,

I’'m sorry -- | should have indicated in my prior email to you that you don’t need a PayPal account in
order to open up my email and pay the invoice. The email will come to your email indicating it is from
“official court reporter”. You are able to just open that email up and input your card info yourself.

| will email you this PayPal invoice shortly.

If you have any questions, please email me back.

Sincerely,

Heather Hartwig

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>

Sent: Monday, January 10, 2022 4:46 PM

To: Heather Hartwig <HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re:

Dear Heather Hartwig,

Yes, | will be order the transcripts.

| do not have a PayPal account.

| do have a debit card or we can use a ACH Bank transfer.

Let me know how best to pay you.

Thank You,
Paul

On Jan 10, 2022, at 4:33 PM, Heather Hartwig <HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
wrote:

Dear Mr. Dulberg,


mailto:HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

| am estimating the cost for the four transcripts you inquired about in case 12 LA 178 —
2/4/15,4/16/14, 8/14/13, 1/30/13 — to be $110.

If you would like to order those transcripts, please email me back and | will send you a
PayPal invoice to pay for the estimate with a credit or debit card. If you’d rather, you are
also able to send me a check or pay with cash.

Sincerely,

Heather Hartwig

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click
links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is
safe.

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was
actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk
at extension 4828.
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