
Date : 12/5/2022 11:30:42 AM
From : "Judy Carlson" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] 17LA377 Report of proceeding purchase request 12/5/2022
 
Good Morning, Mr. Dulberg,

I will be the court reporter responsible for preparing the transcripts regarding the above-mentioned cause.  The 
estimate for the transcript is $100.00.  I will send you an invoice once the transcript is complete through which you 
can make payment online.

If you need further assistance, please feel free to contact me.

Thank you,

Judy Carlson, CSR
Official Court Reporter
Court Reporting Services Supervisor
2200 N. Seminary Ave. Suite 355
Woodstock, IL 60098
(815) 334-4373

-----Original Message-----
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Monday, December 5, 2022 10:21 AM
To: Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] 17LA377 Report of proceeding purchase request 12/5/2022

Dear Judy Carlson,

I am requesting and would like to purchase a report of proceeding for case number 17LA377.
The date of the court event is 12/5/2022.

Please advise.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter.

Sincerely.
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments 
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common 
spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.


