Date : 2/1/2023 2:59:55 PM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Judy Carlson"

Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] 17LA377 Request for Report of Proceeding 02/01/2023

Dear Judy Carlson,
Yes, please proceed with the transcript.

Thank you,
Paul

> On Feb 1, 2023, at 2:57 PM, Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:
>

> Good Afternoon, Mr. Dulberg,

>

> The estimate for the cost of the transcript from today's hearing before Judge Joel Berg is $120.00. I will not
require a deposit.

> Please let me know if you would like me to proceed with preparing the transcript.

>

> Thank you,

>

> Judy

> From: Paul Dulberg <Paul Dulberg@comcast.net>

> Sent: Wednesday, February 1, 2023 10:41 AM

> To: Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>

> Subject: [EXTERNAL] 17LA377 Request for Report of Proceeding 02/01/2023

>

> Dear Judy Carlson,

>

> [ am requesting and would like to purchase a certified PDF transcript or Report of Proceedings for todays date
February 1, 2023 for Case Number 17LA377.

>

> The proceeding took place in Room 201 in front of Judge Berg at 9:50 AM.

>

> Please advise.

>

> Thank you in advance for your help with this matter.

>

> Sincerely,

> Paul

>

> Paul Dulberg

> Pdulberg@jicloud.com

> 847-497-4250

> 4606 Hayden Ct.

> McHenry, IL 60051

>

> CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

>

> While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common
spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from paul dulberg@comcast.net



>
> If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.



