
Date : 2/21/2023 2:52:19 PM
From : "CircuitClerk-MB" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] Digital Records Request for case 17LA000377
Attachment : 2017LA000377 COVID NOTICE.pdf; 
 
Thank you for your payment! Attached please find a copy of the document you requested. 
 
Patty
Administrative Specialist
McHenry County Circuit Clerk
circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov
 
 
 

From: CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 11:59 AM
To: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Digital Records Request for case 17LA000377
 
Yes we can get that. I’m so glad you were able to get what you needed so we don’t have to fight with 
email! 
 
 
*** THIS IS FOR ELECTRONIC COPIES ONLY ***
 
Please reference EXACTLY this Case # 2017LA000377
 
The total cost for your request will be $4.00.  To submit payment, follow the instructions for payment 
options on the link below:
 
https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/cyg/plc/6650
 
Upon receipt of payment, I will forward the requested document in the order that they came in as time 
allows. 
 
Thank you,
Patty
Administrative Specialist
McHenry County Circuit Clerk
circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov
 
 
 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 11:14 AM
To: CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Digital Records Request for case 17LA000377

mailto:circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov
https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/cyg/plc/6650
mailto:circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov
mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com
mailto:CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov


 
Hi Patty,
 
I am canceling the request as I was in the clerks office this morning and picked up what I needed.
 
However, I do have one item I cannot find:
 
04/03/2020 201 STATUS - CHECK NOTICE - COVID19 PARTIAL SHUTDOWN MEYER 
 
Any chance I can purchase a PDF of the above NOTICE?
 
Thank you again,
Paul
 
 

On Feb 21, 2023, at 9:31 AM, CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov> wrote:
 
It will be quite lengthy as there are over 2500 pages in the file. It will also be difficult to 
send electronically. It will have to be in pieces.
 
 
*** THIS IS FOR ELECTRONIC COPIES ONLY ***
 
Please reference EXACTLY this Case # 2017LA000377
 
The total cost for your request will be $655.50.  To submit payment, follow the instructions 
for payment options on the link below:
 
https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/cyg/plc/6650
 
Upon receipt of payment, I will forward the requested document in the order that they 
came in as time allows.
 
Thank you,
Patty
Administrative Specialist
McHenry County Circuit Clerk
circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov
 
 
 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Monday, February 20, 2023 10:09 AM
To: CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Digital Records Request for case 17LA000377 
 

mailto:CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov
https://urldefense.com/v3/__https:/www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/cyg/plc/6650__;!!Aql9viJT!TZGeHTfepSdoVf5Aj3Zj97dQOHKWrotq5fnBwmWLMZUH2_7GgMrkv6zoN_9x20gFl5b5TnJk099il2wiELWHuRYQqQdTUP0$
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Hello,

I am requesting digital copies of all public records including hearing transcripts for case 
17LA000377

I understand there may be fee’s associated with this request and will wait for you to tell 
me the total amount needed and how to go about paying.

Please let me know if there is anything else you need.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter,

Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
pdulberg@icloud.com

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not 
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the 

content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email 

was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the 
helpdesk at extension 4828.

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click 
links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 

safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was 

actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk 
at extension 4828.
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KATHERINE M. KEEFE


Clerk of the Circuit Court
22ND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT


McHENRY COUNTY


WOODSTOCK, ILLINOIS  60098


www.mchenrycircuitclerk.org


17LA000377


03/19/2020


EDWARD X CLINTON, JR
111 W WASHINGTON
STE 1437
CHICAGO, IL 60602


DEAR EDWARD X CLINTON, JR,


DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET ALRE: 17LA000377


NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED COURT DATE DUE TO COVID-19


You were scheduled to appear in the McHenry County Circuit Court on 04/03/2020 at  9:00 AM.  Your case 


is being continued due to the 22nd Circuit Court’s implementation of Center for Disease Control 


recommendations to reduce the number of public in the Courthouse.


 


Your case has been rescheduled to: 06/05/2020 at  9:00 AM in Courtroom 201.


Michael J. Sullivan Judicial Center


2200 N. Seminary Ave (Route 47)


Woodstock, IL 60098


Sign up for text and/or email reminders of your court date at http://mchenrycourt.date/reminders.  


We apologize for any inconvenience this may have caused.  If you have any questions, please call the 


Circuit Clerk's office at (815) 334-4190.


Sincerely,


Katherine M. Keefe


Clerk of the Circuit Court







KATHERINE M. KEEFE


Clerk of the Circuit Court
22ND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT


McHENRY COUNTY


WOODSTOCK, ILLINOIS  60098


www.mchenrycircuitclerk.org


17LA000377


03/19/2020


PAUL  DULBERG
4606 HAYDEN CT
MCHENRY, IL 60051


DEAR PAUL  DULBERG,


DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET ALRE: 17LA000377


NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED COURT DATE DUE TO COVID-19


You were scheduled to appear in the McHenry County Circuit Court on 04/03/2020 at  9:00 AM.  Your case 


is being continued due to the 22nd Circuit Court’s implementation of Center for Disease Control 


recommendations to reduce the number of public in the Courthouse.


 


Your case has been rescheduled to: 06/05/2020 at  9:00 AM in Courtroom 201.


Michael J. Sullivan Judicial Center


2200 N. Seminary Ave (Route 47)


Woodstock, IL 60098


Sign up for text and/or email reminders of your court date at http://mchenrycourt.date/reminders.  


We apologize for any inconvenience this may have caused.  If you have any questions, please call the 


Circuit Clerk's office at (815) 334-4190.


Sincerely,


Katherine M. Keefe


Clerk of the Circuit Court







KATHERINE M. KEEFE


Clerk of the Circuit Court
22ND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT


McHENRY COUNTY


WOODSTOCK, ILLINOIS  60098


www.mchenrycircuitclerk.org


17LA000377


03/19/2020


KARBAL COHEN ECONOMOU SILK & DUNNE LLC


GEORGE K FLYNN
150 S WACKER DR
STE 1700
CHICAGO, IL 60606


DEAR GEORGE K FLYNN,


DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET ALRE: 17LA000377


NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED COURT DATE DUE TO COVID-19


You were scheduled to appear in the McHenry County Circuit Court on 04/03/2020 at  9:00 AM.  Your case 


is being continued due to the 22nd Circuit Court’s implementation of Center for Disease Control 


recommendations to reduce the number of public in the Courthouse.


 


Your case has been rescheduled to: 06/05/2020 at  9:00 AM in Courtroom 201.


Michael J. Sullivan Judicial Center


2200 N. Seminary Ave (Route 47)


Woodstock, IL 60098


Sign up for text and/or email reminders of your court date at http://mchenrycourt.date/reminders.  


We apologize for any inconvenience this may have caused.  If you have any questions, please call the 


Circuit Clerk's office at (815) 334-4190.


Sincerely,


Katherine M. Keefe


Clerk of the Circuit Court







KATHERINE M. KEEFE


Clerk of the Circuit Court
22ND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT


McHENRY COUNTY


WOODSTOCK, ILLINOIS  60098


www.mchenrycircuitclerk.org


17LA000377


03/19/2020


HANS  MAST
3416 W ELM ST
MCHENRY, IL 60050


DEAR HANS  MAST,


DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET ALRE: 17LA000377


NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED COURT DATE DUE TO COVID-19


You were scheduled to appear in the McHenry County Circuit Court on 04/03/2020 at  9:00 AM.  Your case 


is being continued due to the 22nd Circuit Court’s implementation of Center for Disease Control 


recommendations to reduce the number of public in the Courthouse.


 


Your case has been rescheduled to: 06/05/2020 at  9:00 AM in Courtroom 201.


Michael J. Sullivan Judicial Center


2200 N. Seminary Ave (Route 47)


Woodstock, IL 60098


Sign up for text and/or email reminders of your court date at http://mchenrycourt.date/reminders.  


We apologize for any inconvenience this may have caused.  If you have any questions, please call the 


Circuit Clerk's office at (815) 334-4190.


Sincerely,


Katherine M. Keefe


Clerk of the Circuit Court







KATHERINE M. KEEFE


Clerk of the Circuit Court
22ND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT


McHENRY COUNTY


WOODSTOCK, ILLINOIS  60098


www.mchenrycircuitclerk.org


17LA000377


03/19/2020


POPOVICH PC, THOMAS J, LAW OFFICES OF


POPOVICH PC, THOMAS J, LAW OFFICES OF
3416 W ELM ST
MCHENRY, IL 60050


DEAR POPOVICH PC, THOMAS J, LAW OFFICES OF,


DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET ALRE: 17LA000377


NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED COURT DATE DUE TO COVID-19


You were scheduled to appear in the McHenry County Circuit Court on 04/03/2020 at  9:00 AM.  Your case 


is being continued due to the 22nd Circuit Court’s implementation of Center for Disease Control 


recommendations to reduce the number of public in the Courthouse.


 


Your case has been rescheduled to: 06/05/2020 at  9:00 AM in Courtroom 201.


Michael J. Sullivan Judicial Center


2200 N. Seminary Ave (Route 47)


Woodstock, IL 60098


Sign up for text and/or email reminders of your court date at http://mchenrycourt.date/reminders.  


We apologize for any inconvenience this may have caused.  If you have any questions, please call the 


Circuit Clerk's office at (815) 334-4190.


Sincerely,


Katherine M. Keefe


Clerk of the Circuit Court





