
Date : 12/22/2022 2:20:36 PM
From : "Alphonse Talarico" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" , "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : attachment to motion for summary judgment
Attachment : Defendants attachment to Motion for Summary Judgment CC-Civil - 
2017LA000377 - 9_19_2022 - - - ZZZ - -.pdf; 
 
Please see the attached





** FILED **   Env: 19541281
McHenry County, Illinois


2017LA000377
Date: 9/19/2022 10:51 AM


Katherine M. Keefe
Clerk of the Circuit Court


2017LA000377
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+ Font Size -


Re: Dave's Best and oldest friend John


From : Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> Tue, Nov 19, 2013 02:29 AN"


Subject: Re: Dave's Best and oldest friend John 


To ; Hans Mast <hansmast@comcast.net>


I still don't get how they don't feel responsible for work done on their property by their own son that ended up cutting through ^10% of 
my arm.


Perhaps their negligence is the fact that they didn't supervise the work close enough but they did oversee much of the days activity with 
David. Just because Dave was doing the work doesn't mean they were not trying to tell their kid what to do. They told him plenty of times 
throughout the day what to do. How is that not supervising?


Paul


Paul Dulberg 
847-497.4250 
Sent from my IPad


> On Nov 18, 2013, at 8:07 PM, Hans Mast <hansmast@comcast.net> wrote:
>
> Paul whether you like it or not they don't have a legal liability for your injury because they were not directing the work. So if we do not 
accept their 5000 they will simply file a motion and get out of the case for free. That's the only other option is letting them file motion 
getting out of the case
>
> Sent from my IPhone
>
» On Nov 18, 2013, at 7:40 PM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:
>>
>> Only 5, That’s not much at all.
» Is this a take it or leave it or do we have any other options?
>>
>> If you want a negligence case for the homeowners ask what happened immediately after the accident.
>>
>> Neither of them offered me any medical assistance nor did either of them call 911 and all Carol could think of besides calling David an 
idiot was calling her homeowners Insurance.
»
>> They all left me out in the yard screaming for help while they were busy making sure they were covered.
>>
>> She even went as far as to finally call the Emergency Room after I was already there just to tell me she was covered.
»
>> How selfish are people when they worry about if Oieir insured over helping the person who was hurt and bleeding badly in their yard. 
>>
>> I'm glad she got her answer and had to share it with me only to find out her coverage won’t even pay the medical bills.
>>
» I'm not happy with the offer.
»
» As far as John Choyinskl, he knows he has to call you and said he will tomorrow.
»
>> Paul 
»
>> Paul Dulberg 
» 847-497-4250 
>> Sent from my IPad


--■■Z
KHlilT#>>> On Nov 18, 2013, at 1:28 PM, Hans Mast <hansmast@comcast.net> wrote:


>>>
> > > Im waiting to hear from John. I tried calling him last week, but no one answered.
>>>
>>> In addition, the McGuire's atty has offered us (you) $5,000 in full settlement of the daim against the McGuires only. As we 
discussed, they have no liability in the case for what Dave did as property owners. So they will likely get out of the case on a motion at


o- POR,OnM«t
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some point, so my suggestion Is to take the $5,000 now. You probably won't see any of it due to liens etc. but it will offset the costs 
deducted from any eventual recovery....
>>>
>>> Let me know what you think..
>>>
>>> Hans
>>> — Original Message —
>>> From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
>>> To: Hans Mast <hansmast@comcastnet>
»> Sent; Fri, 15 Nov 2013 22:41:26 -OOOO (UTC)
>>> Subject: Dave’s Best and oldest friend John 
>>> Hans,
>>> Just spoke with John Choyinski again about talking with you.
>>> I am leaving your number with him as he has agreed to talk with you about David Gagnon.
>>> I believe he will try and call sometime tomorrow.
>>> Paul
>>> Oh and I know that nothing that happened right after the incident makes any difference as to the validity of the injuries but David’s 
conduct immediately after the incident does show his lack of moral values for other humans and what he was willing and was not willing 
to do to help me get medical help. For his actions towards me or any other human being is enough to sue the shit out him alone. It is the 
things that happened afterwards that upset me the most,
>>> Sorry for the rant but Dave was a complete ass all the way and deserves this.
>>> Paul Dulberg 
»> 847-497-4250 
>>> Sent from my iPad


paRTioojai
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