Date : 4/25/2023 11:54:44 AM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Law Office Of Alphonse Talarico"
BCec : "Paul Dulberg" , "Tom Kost"
Subject : Re: Fee Payment

Dear Mr Talarico,

I have submitted the third of three payments for fees.
Amount $4000.00
Estimated arrival date: 5/01/2023

Thank You,
Paul

> On Apr 24, 2023, at 8:46 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> wrote:
>

> Dear Mr Talarico,

>

> I have submitted the second of three payments for fees.

> Amount $4000.00

> Estimated arrival date: 4/28/2023

>

> Tomorrow I will submit the third.

>

> Please forgive that I didn't send it sooner, with Mike's passing I simply was overwhelmed.
>

> Thank You,

> Paul

>

>

>> On Apr 20, 2023, at 9:08 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> wrote:
>>

>> Dear Mr Talarico,

>>

>> [ have submitted the first of three payments for fees.

>> Amount $4000.00

>> Estimated arrival date: 4/26/2023

>>

>> Tomorrow I will submit a second and the day after that a third.

>>

>> Thank You,

>> Paul

>>

>



