
Date : 12/24/2023 9:26:31 AM
From : "Alphonse Talarico" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Cc : "Tom Kost" 
Subject : Re: Veritext Invoice for Dulberg v. Baudins et al 2022L010905
 
Thank you!
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>
Sent: Sunday, December 24, 2023 8:19 AM
To: Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>
Cc: Tom Kost <tkost999@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Veritext Invoice for Dulberg v. Baudins et al 2022L010905 
 
Dear Mr Talarico, 
Today I have mailed to you check number 1055 in the amount of $329.00 for the Vetitext, LLC 
invoice # 7052892.
Thank you,
Paul  

On Dec 19, 2023, at 10:20 AM, Alphonse Talarico 
<contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com> wrote:

Gentlemen,
Please see the enclosed invoice.
Thank you,
Alphonse A. Talarico, Esq.
<Veritext Invoice for Dulberg v. Baudin in Trial Court  ADR motion for sanctions 
7052892.pdf>


