Date : 1/23/2024 11:52:26 AM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Law Office Of Alphonse Talarico"

Cc: "Tom Kost"

Subject : Re: Your families current invoices as ordered totalling $452.46

Attachment : Binder38.pdf; ATT00002.bin; fcm-hero-envelope-colors.jpg; ATT00004.bin;
Dear Mr Talarico,

Today I have mailed you a single check (No. 1057) in the amount of $123.46 for the following
two invoices only:

$51.44 - Kost Fees for docketing Statement.pdf

$72.02 - Kost Fees for preparation og the record on appeal.pdf

On January 20, 2024 I mailed you check No. 1056 in the amount of 329.00 for the Veritext
invoice #7108556.

Attached is a PDF named "Binder38.pdf" which is a copy of your original email requesting the
Veritext invoice be paid and my reply email stating that I mailed the check.




From: Alphonse Talarico contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com &
Subject: Please see the attached
Date: January 16, 2024 at 3:46 PM
To: Paul Dulberg pdulberg@icloud.com, Paul Dulberg Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net, T Kost tkost999 @gmail.com
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Veritext, LLC - Midwest Region

Tel. 312.442.9087 Email: billing-midwest@veritext.com
Fed. Tax ID: 20-3132569

Bill To: Alphonse A. Talarico Esq
Alphonse Talarico Law Offices
707 Skokie Boulevard
Suite 600
Northbrook, IL, 60062

VERITEXT
lLEGAL SOLUTIONS

Invoice #: 7108556
Invoice Date: 1/12/2024
Balance Due: $329.00

Case: Dulberg, Paul R., Etc., Et Al. v. Baudin, Kelly N., Et Al.
(2022.010905)

Proceeding Type: Hearing

Job #: 6392239 | Job Date: 1/11/2024 | Delivery: None
Location:

Billing Atty:

Chicago, IL
Alphonse A. Talarico Esq

Scheduling Atty:  Alphonse A. Talarico Esq | Alphonse Talarico Law Offices

Witness: Hearing Amount
Professional Attendance $290.00
Logistics, Processing & Electronic Files $39.00

Notes: Invoice Total: $329.00
Payment: $0.00

Credit: $0.00

Interest: $0.00

Balance Due: $329.00

please consult http://www.veritext.com/services/all-services/services-information

TERMS: Payable upon receipt. Accounts 30 days past due will bear a finance charge of 1.5% per month. Accounts unpaid after 90 days agree to pay all collection costs,
including reasonable attorney's fees. Contact us to correct payment errors. No adjustments will be made after 90 days. For more information on charges related to our services

15125

Remit to:

Veritext

P.O. Box 71303
Chicago IL 60694-1303
Fed. Tax ID: 20-3132569

Pay By ACH (Include invoice numbers):
A/C Name:Veritext
Bank Name:BMO Harris Bank
Bank Addr:311 W. Monroe Chicago, IL 60606
Account No0:4353454 ABA:071000288
Swift: HATRUS44

Invoice #: 7108556
Invoice Date: 1/12/2024
Balance Due: $329.00

Pay by Credit Card: www.veritext.com




https://ws4.veritextllc.com/CreditCardApp/?TokenNo=sTFQF7UPmdu&ConfirmationNo=6392239

https://ws4.veritextllc.com/CreditCardApp/?TokenNo=sTFQF7UPmdu&ConfirmationNo=6392239



From: Paul Dulberg Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net
Subject: Re: Please see the attached
Date: January 20, 2024 at 5:30 AM
To: Law Office Of Alphonse Talarico contact@Ilawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com
Cc: Tom Kost tkost999 @gmail.com
Bcc: Paul Dulberg Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net

Dear Mr Talarico,

Today | have mailed to you check number 1056 in the amount of $329.00 for the Vetitext, LLC invoice # 7108556.

Paul

On Jan 16, 2024, at 3:46 PM, Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com> wrote:

<Veritext Court Reporter ADR SCR 137 Petition 7108556.pdf>
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Seeing that only 2 buisness days have passed, please use the following link to understand why you may not have received the letter containing the check for the Veritext invoice yet:
		











		

				First-Class Mail & Postage
usps.com













Paul 




 
On Jan 23, 2024, at 10:56 AM, Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com> wrote:

Please pay $452.46 to Alphonse A. Talarico Esq. as costs as ordered.




Thank you,
Alphonse a. Talarico Esq.

<Veritext 7108556 as ordered by Paul R. Dulberg on January 11, 2024.pdf><Kost Fees for docketing Statement.pdf><Kost Fees for preparation og the record on appeal.pdf>





