
From: Paul Dulberg Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net
Subject: Re: Paul Dulberg et al. v. ADR Systems of America, LLC Post Judgement

Date: May 9, 2025 at 1:50 PM
To: Robert Chapman rchapman@chapmanspingola.com
Cc: smehrotra@chapmanspingola.com, Tom Kost tkost999@gmail.com, Alphonse Talarico contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com,

Alphonse Talarico alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com, Alphonse Talarico alphonsetalarico@gmail.com, Tom Long
tlong@konicekdillonlaw.com

Robert Chapman

I am on a fixed income (SSDI), my Blind Mother is on a fixed income and lives here.

I need to know:

1. How much and when do you plan on collecting money from Mr. Talarico?

2. How much and when do you plan on collecting money from Dulberg?

Paul Dulberg
Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net
(847) 497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

On May 8, 2025, at 1:44 PM, Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Mr Chapman,

Please inform us:

1. How much and when you plan on collecting money from Mr. Talarico?

2. How much and when you plan on collecting money from Dulberg?

I need this basic information to be able to have enough money on hand.

Paul Dulberg
Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net
(847) 497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

On May 8, 2025, at 11:25 AM, Tom Long <tlong@konicekdillonlaw.com> wrote:

I cannot answer those questions.  If you have some thoughts on payment, you should direct those to Mr. Chapman since he will decide
how to collect on the Order.

Thomas J. Long
Konicek & Dillon, P.C.
21 W. State St.
Geneva, Il.  60134
(P) 630-262-9655
(F) 630-262-9659
tlong@konicekdillonlaw.com

-----Original Message-----
From: Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net>
Sent: Thursday, May 8, 2025 11:07 AM
To: Tom Long <tlong@konicekdillonlaw.com>
Cc: Robert Chapman <rchapman@chapmanspingola.com>; smehrotra@chapmanspingola.com; Tom Kost <tkost999@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Paul Dulberg et al. v. ADR Systems of America, LLC Post Judgement

We owe this money jointly and severally.

How much do you intend to pay?

When do you intend to pay?

I need this information to make sure ADR is paid the full amount.

Paul Dulberg
Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net
(847) 497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

On May 8, 2025, at 10:21 AM, Tom Long <tlong@konicekdillonlaw.com> wrote:

Yes I am in a limited capacity.

Thomas J. Long
Konicek & Dillon, P.C.
21 W. State St.
Geneva, Il.  60134
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Geneva, Il.  60134
(P) 630-262-9655
(F) 630-262-9659
tlong@konicekdillonlaw.com

-----Original Message-----
From: Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net>
Sent: Wednesday, May 7, 2025 4:54 PM
To: Tom Long <tlong@konicekdillonlaw.com>
Cc: Robert Chapman <rchapman@chapmanspingola.com>; smehrotra@chapmanspingola.com; Tom Kost <tkost999@gmail.com>
Subject: Paul Dulberg et al. v. ADR Systems of America, LLC Post Judgement

Mr Long,

Are you retained by Mr Talarico for the issue concerning the post judgement award owed to ADR Systems?

Paul

Paul Dulberg
Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net
(847) 497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051
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