
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Medical update

Date: December 28, 2016 11:33:46 AM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Date: June 8, 2012 at 12:05:46 PM CDT
To: Hans Mast <hansmast@comcast.net>
Cc: Janet Douglass <janet@ssdatty.com>
Subject: Medical update

Hi Hans,

Wednesday I met with Dr. Sagerman and I signed the papers for surgery on my right arm. They are going to do an ulnar nerve
decompression and transposition, and a neurolysis in the forearm. They are also going to explore and repair any other damage they
find with the muscles, tendons and remove scar tissue. I am waiting on a call to find out when and where the surgery will be. They
said it should be in the next 4 weeks.

I also need to get some sort of medical release signed by my primary care physician for the surgery so I met with Dr. Sek yesterday
and he gave me a checkup and signed the forms.

On another note, when we last met you asked if any of the Dr.ʼs had been paid yet. I answered no but that wasn't true. I have paid
Dr. Sek in full for each visit and Dr. Levin has been partially paid. I also had to just sign a form for Dr. Sangerman allowing them to
charge my credit card $40 a month till my bill was paid in full. I asked if they would do the surgery on a lean against a settlement
and gave them your name and number to contact you. They said they would but still required I give them permission to charge my
credit card.

If you need anything else please let me know.

Thanks for everything,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad
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