
From: Joe Olsen jolsenlaw@comcast.net
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178

Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:07 PM
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved!  Our new address is noted above.  Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain  the same. 
Thank  you.

---------- Original Message ---------- 
From: "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" <kelly@blgltd.com> 
To: jolsenlaw@comcast.net 
Cc: "Attorney W. Randal Baudin II" <randy@blgltd.com> 
Date: December 19, 2016 at 5:49 PM 
Subject: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178 

Mr. Olsen:

It was a pleasure talking to you today.  Thank you for the information regarding the Dynamic Hand Therapy lien.  I have attached my
spreadsheet of liens, costs and fees along with Mr. Dulberg’s Special Damages List, copies of liens and copies of costs from Mr.
Dulberg’s prior attorneys.  Please review and let me know what questions you have and we can discuss how to proceed.

Very truly yours,

Kelly
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From: Joe Olsen jolsenlaw@comcast.net
Subject: Fwd: Re: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178

Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:08 PM
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved!  Our new address is noted above.  Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain  the same. 
Thank  you.

---------- Original Message ---------- 
From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net> 
To: "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" <kelly@blgltd.com> 
Date: December 22, 2016 at 9:06 AM 
Subject: Re: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178 

Kelly-

Are we getting a "clean" settlement check?

In other words, are the only payees on the check going to be your firm and either the debtor and/or myself as Trustee?

If we are, we don't really have to address these medical lien claims at this time;

Also, the settlement draft appears to be enough to pay all creditors in full whether or not there is a lien, so probably just not an issue;

Is the amount you have given me for your firm ($117,000. net fees, and $84.63 in costs) a "final" number?

If so I'll apply to the court to authorize your payment;

Thank you.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635
Fax (815)965-4573

On December 21, 2016 at 8:57 AM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" <kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Joe-

I received the Release. Can you please initial on the first page? Allstate put the wrong address and rather than redoing the Release
they wanted us to correct it and initial it, so please initial.  We will then send it to Mr. Dulberg for his signature as well since
Allstate is requiring his as well. 
Let me know if you have any questions. 
Kelly  

Attorney Kelly N. Baudin | PO Box 1678 Crystal Lake, IL 60039 |  T 779.994.4639 | F 815.425.2310

This e-mail and any attachments may contain protected, privileged or confidential information intended for the exclusive use of
the recipient(s) named above. Dissemination, distribution or copying by other persons is prohibited.

On Dec 21, 2016, at 8:31 AM, Attorney Kelly N. Baudin < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Sorry about that. I need to update my signature block. Did you send it to 312-800-7494? That's the correct fax.

I will talk to you soon regarding the other issues. 
Thanks, 
Kelly 

Attorney Kelly N. Baudin | PO Box 1678 Crystal Lake, IL 60039 |  T 779.994.4639 | F 815.425.2310

This e-mail and any attachments may contain protected, privileged or confidential information intended for the exclusive use of
the recipient(s) named above. Dissemination, distribution or copying by other persons is prohibited.
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On Dec 21, 2016, at 8:29 AM, Joe Olsen < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote: 

Kelly-

Fax would not go thru, I'll send to Chi. fax #.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635
Fax (815)965-4573

On December 21, 2016 at 7:57 AM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Thanks. Let me know what you want to do to proceed with the liens and if anything should be done on any other medical
bills.

Kelly 

Attorney Kelly N. Baudin | PO Box 1678 Crystal Lake, IL 60039 |  T 779.994.4639 | F 815.425.2310

This e-mail and any attachments may contain protected, privileged or confidential information intended for the exclusive
use of the recipient(s) named above. Dissemination, distribution or copying by other persons is prohibited.

On Dec 21, 2016, at 7:37 AM, Joe Olsen < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote: 

Kelly-

Should have release faxed to you soon.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635
Fax (815)965-4573

On December 20, 2016 at 5:46 PM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Mr. Olsen:

The release usually has this kind of language to make sure that they are held harmless from anyone coming after them
for bills not being paid.  I am not aware of any other liens on this case, which is what “must” be paid from the
settlement.  The only claims that attach to his settlement funds are properly executed liens, which I have provided to
you.  The adjuster advised that she has no liens on this file.  Furthermore, it is irrelevant that Allstate states that we are
agreeing that all medical providers are paid from the settlement funds because the only ones that we are obligated to
pay have executed liens.  Accordingly, this boilerplate language appears to be just that and if we want to receive
payment on this case, Allstate will require us to sign it. If you are in agreement, please sign and return this at your
earliest convenience as I believe the adjuster leaves the office for the holiday on Thursday and we would like to get the
check to you as soon as possible so that everything is ready for distribution at the time of the bankruptcy hearing.

I am happy to discuss the liens with you further and how you would like to proceed.  Also, if you would like to discuss
the other medical bills that don’t have liens, feel free to call.

Thanks!

Kelly 

On Dec 20, 2016, at 2:36 PM, Joe Olsen < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote:
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On Dec 20, 2016, at 2:36 PM, Joe Olsen < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote:

The proposed release, 2nd to last para. on P. 1, has interesting language; 
If whatever Kelly sent is the entire universe of claims against the PI settlement, I guess I don't mind signing..... 
Are these all the claims? Are we reasonably certain no other claims exist? 

On December 19, 2016 at 5:49 PM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Mr. Olsen:

It was a pleasure talking to you today.  Thank you for the information regarding the Dynamic Hand Therapy lien.
 I have attached my spreadsheet of liens, costs and fees along with Mr. Dulberg’s Special Damages List, copies of
liens and copies of costs from Mr. Dulberg’s prior attorneys.  Please review and let me know what questions you
have and we can discuss how to proceed.

Very truly yours,

Kelly
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From: Julia WIlliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178

Date: December 17, 2019 at 6:19 PM
To: George Flynn gflynn@KARBALLAW.COM

#6

Julia Williams
Of Counsel
The Clinton Law Firm
111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515
F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender 
immediately. 

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Re: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:08:42 PM CST
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved!  Our new address is noted above.  Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain  the same.  
Thank  you.

---------- Original Message ---------- 
From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net> 
To: "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" <kelly@blgltd.com> 
Date: December 22, 2016 at 9:06 AM 
Subject: Re: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178 

Kelly-

Are we getting a "clean" settlement check?

In other words, are the only payees on the check going to be your firm and either the debtor and/or myself as Trustee?

If we are, we don't really have to address these medical lien claims at this time;

Also, the settlement draft appears to be enough to pay all creditors in full whether or not there is a lien, so probably just not an 
issue;

Is the amount you have given me for your firm ($117,000. net fees, and $84.63 in costs) a "final" number?

If so I'll apply to the court to authorize your payment;

Thank you.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635
Fax (815)965-4573

On December 21, 2016 at 8:57 AM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" <kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Joe-

I received the Release. Can you please initial on the first page? Allstate put the wrong address and rather than redoing the 
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mailto:jolsenlaw@comcast.net
mailto:juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
mailto:jolsenlaw@comcast.net
mailto:jolsenlaw@comcast.net
mailto:jolsenlaw@comcast.net
mailto:kelly@blgltd.com
mailto:kelly@blgltd.com


I received the Release. Can you please initial on the first page? Allstate put the wrong address and rather than redoing the 
Release they wanted us to correct it and initial it, so please initial.  We will then send it to Mr. Dulberg for his signature as well 
since Allstate is requiring his as well. 
Let me know if you have any questions. 
Kelly  

Attorney Kelly N. Baudin | PO Box 1678 Crystal Lake, IL 60039 |  T 779.994.4639 | F 815.425.2310

This e-mail and any attachments may contain protected, privileged or confidential information intended for the exclusive use of 
the recipient(s) named above. Dissemination, distribution or copying by other persons is prohibited.

On Dec 21, 2016, at 8:31 AM, Attorney Kelly N. Baudin < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Sorry about that. I need to update my signature block. Did you send it to 312-800-7494? That's the correct fax.

I will talk to you soon regarding the other issues. 
Thanks, 
Kelly 

Attorney Kelly N. Baudin | PO Box 1678 Crystal Lake, IL 60039 |  T 779.994.4639 | F 815.425.2310

This e-mail and any attachments may contain protected, privileged or confidential information intended for the exclusive use 
of the recipient(s) named above. Dissemination, distribution or copying by other persons is prohibited.

On Dec 21, 2016, at 8:29 AM, Joe Olsen < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote: 

Kelly-

Fax would not go thru, I'll send to Chi. fax #.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635
Fax (815)965-4573

On December 21, 2016 at 7:57 AM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Thanks. Let me know what you want to do to proceed with the liens and if anything should be done on any other medical 
bills.

Kelly 

Attorney Kelly N. Baudin | PO Box 1678 Crystal Lake, IL 60039 |  T 779.994.4639 | F 815.425.2310

This e-mail and any attachments may contain protected, privileged or confidential information intended for the exclusive 
use of the recipient(s) named above. Dissemination, distribution or copying by other persons is prohibited.

On Dec 21, 2016, at 7:37 AM, Joe Olsen < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote: 

Kelly-

Should have release faxed to you soon.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635
Fax (815)965-4573

On December 20, 2016 at 5:46 PM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Mr. Olsen:

The release usually has this kind of language to make sure that they are held harmless from anyone coming after 
them for bills not being paid.  I am not aware of any other liens on this case, which is what “must” be paid from the 
settlement.  The only claims that attach to his settlement funds are properly executed liens, which I have provided to 
you.  The adjuster advised that she has no liens on this file.  Furthermore, it is irrelevant that Allstate states that we 
are agreeing that all medical providers are paid from the settlement funds because the only ones that we are 
obligated to pay have executed liens.  Accordingly, this boilerplate language appears to be just that and if we want to 
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receive payment on this case, Allstate will require us to sign it. If you are in agreement, please sign and return this at 
your earliest convenience as I believe the adjuster leaves the office for the holiday on Thursday and we would like to 
get the check to you as soon as possible so that everything is ready for distribution at the time of the bankruptcy 
hearing.

I am happy to discuss the liens with you further and how you would like to proceed.  Also, if you would like to 
discuss the other medical bills that don’t have liens, feel free to call.

Thanks!

Kelly 

On Dec 20, 2016, at 2:36 PM, Joe Olsen < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote:

The proposed release, 2nd to last para. on P. 1, has interesting language; 
If whatever Kelly sent is the entire universe of claims against the PI settlement, I guess I don't mind signing..... 
Are these all the claims? Are we reasonably certain no other claims exist? 

On December 19, 2016 at 5:49 PM "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" < kelly@blgltd.com> wrote: 

Mr. Olsen:

It was a pleasure talking to you today.  Thank you for the information regarding the Dynamic Hand Therapy 
lien.  I have attached my spreadsheet of liens, costs and fees along with Mr. Dulberg’s Special Damages List, 
copies of liens and copies of costs from Mr. Dulberg’s prior attorneys.  Please review and let me know what 
questions you have and we can discuss how to proceed.

Very truly yours,

Kelly
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From: Julia WIlliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178

Date: February 10, 2020 at 3:11 PM
To: Paul Dulberg paul_dulberg@comcast.net, Ed Clinton ed@clintonlaw.net, Mary Winch marywinch@clintonlaw.net

Paul, 

Email #6 from Joe Olsen

Julia Williams
Of Counsel
The Clinton Law Firm
111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515
F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender 
immediately. 

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:07:05 PM CST
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved!  Our new address is noted above.  Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain  the same.  
Thank  you.

---------- Original Message ---------- 
From: "Attorney Kelly N. Baudin" <kelly@blgltd.com> 
To: jolsenlaw@comcast.net 
Cc: "Attorney W. Randal Baudin II" <randy@blgltd.com> 
Date: December 19, 2016 at 5:49 PM 
Subject: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178 

Mr. Olsen:

It was a pleasure talking to you today.  Thank you for the information regarding the Dynamic Hand Therapy lien.  I have attached 
my spreadsheet of liens, costs and fees along with Mr. Dulberg’s Special Damages List, copies of liens and copies of costs from Mr. 
Dulberg’s prior attorneys.  Please review and let me know what questions you have and we can discuss how to proceed.

Very truly yours,

Kelly
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