From: Joe Olsen jolsenlaw@comcast.net &
Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 1:55 PM
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

‘We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.
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From: Joe Olsen jolsenlaw@comcast.net &
Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 1:56 PM
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

‘We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.
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From: Joe Olsen jolsenlaw@comcast.net &
Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:00 PM
To: juliawiliams@clintonlaw.net

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

‘We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.

---------- Original Message ----------

From: Myrna Boyce <myrna@blgltd.com>

To: jolsenlaw@comcast.net

Date: September 27, 2016 at 5:00 PM

Subject: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178

Dear Mr. Olsen:
Attached please find the attorney affidavit and also a copy of the fee agreement regarding Mr. Dulberg's case.

Additionally, we have received a check in the amount of $1,000.00 from the medical payments provision of the insured's home
owner's policy available to Mr. Dulberg.
Are we able to disburse those funds to him or is that something that needs to be held pending the bk case?

Thank you,

Myrna

Myrna E. Boyce, Legal Assistant

--------- Original Message ---------

Subject: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
From: jolsenlaw@comcast.net

Date: 9/16/16 11:24 am

To: randybaudin2 @gmail.com

Cc: myrna@blgltd.com

Randy-

Nice talking w/ you today, below is contact info.
Thanks.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635

Fax (815)965-4573
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FEE AGREEMENT

I, Paul Dulberg, hereby agree to retain and employ BAUDIN & BAUDIN, an
usodaﬁonof:ﬂomeygmpmwcmmd/ormﬂedlmiumdchimsfwdlmms,wbkhm:y
hdudcpmalinjurksmdmputydlmmmmpmﬁblemmchﬂingmek
insanneccompmjsmdmyhmc«npmies,amyubampomiblcinm
companies,uisingomdmwhichocqumdmoraboutthezs‘dayo”une.zoll.uor
near 1016 W. Elder Avenue, McHenry, llinois.

I agree to pay BAUDIN & BAUDIN as compensation for services (1) a non-refundable
retainer fee of$3,333.33;AND(2)amofmmcyequl to one-third (1/3) of the gross amount
mlizedﬁomlhisclaimbysenlunmpdowtouidofﬂnismnna,omifthismmerpmceodsm
uianhichisdeﬁmdumyﬁmcaﬁerﬂ:eﬁndmialoonfmmmeCounhu
ooncluded,lwtoplyBAUDIN&BAUDlNasoompmsaﬁonfmitsservieesamof

lmlm,mdmdwwmmmmmmmdmmychh,webn
medimlexpmsesfamylanmmdmtmdrdmdmnﬂumform
medical teoordsmdbills,nwcllascouncosts,inclwing filing fees, costs of depositions, costs
ofcxpametc.mmyobﬁpﬁmmdmponsibilitymddnubepddasmosebiusbecmwdue
from time to time.

hisﬁnhanaeedmdmdemooddnﬂhmwiﬂbemﬁuﬂwchmforbplmhes
over and above the $3,333.33 non-refundable retainer fee by BAUDIN & BAUDIN (with the
anofdwafmidmmandmnfumdwmwpbnwmmykm
inthiscla'ln.andllmnoseﬂlcmmtwiﬂbemadewilbomtheconsentoﬂhedlimum(s).

lhaebym&oﬁuMdbeaMBAUDlN&BAUDINismMindtomdomnd
depositmypmeedsmceivedinng-dmundmidchhnhmh.mdbdishmd\ose
ﬁmdsfwwmsofcﬁemmmmmmnoflmmﬁnbmauofmdw,md

attomey’s fees.
misuusewasnotsoljchcdeiﬁmdilwdyorhdiwdyﬁommdusbylnyonc. This
agreement is being executed with dnphca;Bnls
SigwdmisEZJthyof S' 5 ?o”/,mdeopymeivedby

claimant(s) or claimant(s)'s representative, ,

Claimant Claimant

BAUDIN-&-BALDIN
2100 N. Huntington Drive, Suite
Algonquin, I. 60102 .

Revised 9/2015 847.658.5295 FAX: 847.658.5015







From: Julia Wllliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net &
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 17, 2019 at 6:17 PM
To: George Flynn gflynn@KARBALLAW.COM

Dear George,
I am forwarding several emails from Joe Olsen. This is his “informal” response to our subpoena.

This is going to be difficult to keep track of but I will do my best. I will forward them this way and maybe come up with a better way to
track.

Best Regards,

Julia Williams

Of Counsel

The Clinton Law Firm

111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515

F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender
immediately.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comecast.net>

Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 1:55:49 PM CST

To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.
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From: Julia Wllliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net &
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 17,2019 at 6:18 PM
To: George Flynn gflynn@KARBALLAW.COM

#2

Julia Williams

Of Counsel

The Clinton Law Firm

111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515

F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender
immediately.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comecast.net>

Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 1:55:56 PM CST

To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.
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From: Julia Wllliams juliawiliams@clintonlaw.net & [** &
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178 L
Date: December 17,2019 at 6:18 PM ‘
To: George Flynn gflynn@KARBALLAW.COM

#3

Julia Williams

Of Counsel

The Clinton Law Firm

111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515

F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender
immediately.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comecast.net>

Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:00:01 PM CST

To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.

—————————— Original Message ----------

From: Myrna Boyce <myrna@blgltd.com>

To: jolsenlaw@comcast.net

Date: September 27, 2016 at 5:00 PM

Subject: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LLA178

Dear Mr. Olsen:

Attached please find the attorney affidavit and also a copy of the fee agreement regarding Mr. Dulberg's case.

Additionally, we have received a check in the amount of $1,000.00 from the medical payments provision of the insured's home
owner's policy available to Mr. Dulberg.

Are we able to disburse those funds to him or is that something that needs to be held pending the bk case?

Thank you,

Myrna

Myrna E. Boyce, Legal Assistant

————————— Original Message ---------

Subject: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
From: jolsenlaw@comecast.net

Date: 9/16/16 11:24 am

To: randybaudin2@gmail.com

Cc: myrna@blgltd.com

Randy-
Nice talking w/ you today, below is contact info.
Thanks.

lncanh N Nlcan
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Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635

Fax (815)965-4573
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FEE AGREEMENT

I, Paul Dulberg, hereby egree to retain and employ BAUDIN & BAUDIN, an
lssociuionofmomcys,wpmsectmmd/orsmledlminmdchimsfwd&mges,wbichmuy
indwepmnliqjuriesmdmpmydamagthmmponﬁuemmchdm;lheh
ins:nncecompmiesmdmyhamecmpmies,ormyabarupomiblcinﬂm
compmies,uisingom»fmwma:mmonmaboumezs‘ayorhme.zon.uor
near 1016 W. Elder Avenue, McHenry, Ilinois.

I agree to pay BAUDIN & BAUDllecanpensdionfmsuvices(l)unonqeﬁmdable
retainerfeeof$3,333.33;AND(2)amofm:cyeqml to one-third (1/3) of the gross amount
mlizcdﬁomlhisclaimbysenlanmprioﬂotrialofﬂtismlner,OR,ifthismmerptoeeedno
uianhiehisdeﬂnedumyﬁmeaﬂaﬂ:eﬁnﬂpm—ﬁdconmethﬂnCounhu
concluderLlwwptyBAUDIN&BAUDINasoompqmﬁonfwitsseMoesammof
moncyequltofmypmem(m)oflhemmoumnaliudﬁomawblcﬁm. Should this
matter conclude by way of settlement, negotiations, trial, arbitration or Jjudgment in my favor,
BAUDIN & BAUDIN agrees to reduce its percentage fee by an amount of $3,333.33 as an
offset for the non-veﬁmdablor\!ninafee;however,innoevenlwillme$3.333.33bemﬁmdedao
me once this agreement has been executed.

lnd'me.mdmdmdwﬂmmmmdmmlmdmmychin,wchn
medimlexpamsfamy/«nmmdmmmdnlmdmanhumforobnhing
nwdiedreoordsandbills,aswelltscouncos&,includingﬁlhgfea,eoﬂsofdeposiﬁom,coﬂs
ofcxmcu:.mmyobﬁpﬁmmdmspmﬂ)ﬂi(ymwbeptidlsmmbiﬂsmdue
from time to time.

hisﬁnhulweedmdmdastooddnlhmwﬂlbenoﬁnﬂ\achmfmbplmius

IbacbyuﬂloﬁumddireaﬂmBAUDlN&BAUDmismm-iudtomdomnd
deposhmypmceedsmodvedinregsdwﬂndmidchlmbmh.mdbdisbmseﬂme
ﬁmdsfmwpomofcﬁeﬂmymmmhﬂionoflmmbmmofmdw,md
attorney’s fees.

Thisumewasnotsolkhedeiﬁmdimcdyorindiwﬂyﬁommdusbynyme_ This
agreement is being executed with duplicate W inals.
Ol .L.‘-?? / N - (- “ '7/\/!/



QIRUCU UUSCE W _a8Y Ol — /T » ' J_, and copy received by
claimant(s) or claimant(s)'s representative,

Claimant

Revised 9/2015 847.658.5295 FAX: 847.658.5015



From: Julia Wllliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net &
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: February 10, 2020 at 3:09 PM
To: Paul Dulberg paul_dulberg@comcast.net
Cc: Mary Winch marywinch@clintonlaw.net, Ed Clinton ed@clintonlaw.net

Paul,
Email #1 from Joe Olsen

Julia Williams

Of Counsel

The Clinton Law Firm

111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515

F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender
immediately.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 1:55:49 PM CST

To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.
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From: Julia Wllliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net &
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: February 10, 2020 at 3:09 PM
To: Paul Dulberg paul_dulberg@comcast.net
Cc: Mary Winch marywinch@clintonlaw.net, Ed Clinton ed@clintonlaw.net

Paul,

Email #2 from Joe Olsen
Julia Williams

Of Counsel

The Clinton Law Firm

111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515

F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender
immediately.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comecast.net>

Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 1:55:56 PM CST

To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.
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From: Julia Wllliams juliawiliams@clintonlaw.net & [**

Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178

Date: February 10, 2020 at 3:09 PM \
To: Paul Dulberg paul_dulberg@comcast.net, Mary Winch marywinch@clintonlaw.net, Ed Clinton ed@clintonlaw.net

Paul,
Email #3 from Joe Olsen

Julia Williams

Of Counsel

The Clinton Law Firm

111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515

F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender
immediately.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Subject: Fwd: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:00:01 PM CST

To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved! Our new address is noted above. Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain the same.
Thank you.

—————————— Original Message ----------

From: Myrna Boyce <myrna@blgltd.com>

To: jolsenlaw@comcast.net

Date: September 27, 2016 at 5:00 PM

Subject: RE: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LLA178

Dear Mr. Olsen:

Attached please find the attorney affidavit and also a copy of the fee agreement regarding Mr. Dulberg's case.

Additionally, we have received a check in the amount of $1,000.00 from the medical payments provision of the insured's home
owner's policy available to Mr. Dulberg.

Are we able to disburse those funds to him or is that something that needs to be held pending the bk case?

Thank you,

Myrna

Myrna E. Boyce, Legal Assistant

————————— Original Message ---------

Subject: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12L.A178
From: jolsenlaw@comecast.net

Date: 9/16/16 11:24 am

To: randybaudin2@gmail.com

Cc: myrna@blgltd.com

Randy-
Nice talking w/ you today, below is contact info.
Thanks.
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Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635

Fax (815)965-4573
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FEE AGREEMENT

I, Paul Dulberg, hereby egree to retain and employ BAUDIN & BAUDIN, an
Wsﬁmoftﬂomeygmmmunﬂmmlcdlmiumdcmmsf«dmngcs,wbkhtnly
hddcmliﬂumsmdmnywwmmmmwngmek
inmnceconpanismdmyimmcmmies,wny«bampomfbleinm
eompanies,uisingomofcvmwhichoouumdmorabouttheza‘dayofhme.mll,uor
near 1016 W. Elder Avenue, McHenry, lllinois.

I agree to pay BAUDIN & BAUD!Nucompenmionfonuvices(l)amn-«eﬁmdable
mtainufeeofﬁ,333.33;AND(2)amofmnyeqml to one-third (1/3) of the gross amount
rulizedﬁomlhisclaimbyseulemempﬁowtou'h!ofdnismma,OR,ifthismmerpmoeodno
Mwhkhhdeﬁmdnmy&ncaﬁaﬂ:eﬁndmialconfmwhhmewm
concluded,lngwcwplyBAUDlN&BAUDmuoompmsaﬁonforiumieesammof
moncyequltofatypemem(m)oflhemmomnmﬁzedﬁomawhwﬁm. Should this
matter conclude by way of settlement, negotiations, trial, arbitration or judgment in my favor,
BAUDIN & BAUDIN agrees to reduce its percentage fee by an amount of $3,333.33 as an
offset for the non-reﬁmdablereainetfee;howeva,innoevenlwillmes3.333.33bemﬁmdedm
me once this agreement has been executed.

lmlbe,mdmdmdagrecﬂmanmwmdeomrelmdmmyehh,n%as
medialcxpmfamykmmmdhemnmundrdmdwﬂssﬂumforobnining
medical mrdsmdbﬂls,aswellasoouncmincluding filing fees, costs of depositions, costs
ofexpens.uc.mmyobﬁgaﬁmmdmponntﬂitymdﬂnﬂbepﬁdaslhmebintbeconwdue
from time to time.

hisﬁnhaapeedmdmdauooddmthmwinbemﬁmhachmfmleplmies
over and above the $3,333.33 non-refundable retainer fee by BAUDIN & BAUDIN (with the
uoemhnofmenfmidmunndcmmkmdwinpmphnmmmhm
inthiscln'm.mdﬁmnose«lemmtwiﬂbemadeﬁlhomtheconseutoﬁbednimm((s).

IherebywmoﬁzemddhalhnBAUDlN&BAUDlNismMiudmmdomnd
depodtmpmadsmodvdhmdbundmidchhnbmh.mdmdismm
Mfawwmofcﬁem”mmwmnoflmwhnbmmofmdvmwd,ud
attorney’s fees.

misamewasnotsolkhedeiﬁmdilwdyorindiwdyﬁmmdusbylnyone. This

aoreement ic heino svamitad with dualicae. ~tor i



s.wmsé/ayof S/Z:“’/“" . ?o/-’/,mdoopyuoeivedby
claimant(s) or claimant(s)'s representative,

Claimant C imant
BAUBIN-&-BAUDIN
2100 N. Huntington Drive, Suite
Algonquin, I. 60102 .

Revised 92015 847.658.5295 FAX: 847.658.5015



