From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Gagnon and McGuire homeowner policies
Date: December 27, 2016 5:07:14 PM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>

Date: February 26, 2015 at 8:23:04 AM CST

To: Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net>

Subject: Re: Gagnon and McGuire homeowner policies

Hans,

I'm not asking to see you.

I'm asking for a copy of the policy numbers and an accounting of all the fees your firm feels it's entitled to.
Please have someone at the office print them out and have them available for pickup.

Thanks in advance again,

Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad

On Feb 26, 2015, at 8:03 AM, Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net> wrote:

I'm not in the office today Paul. If the attorney needs information regarding this he can definitely call me tomorrow
Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 26, 2015, at 8:02 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Then please have a complete accounting of all fees you feel entitled to re guarding these cases ready for pickup by noon.
Thanks,
Paul

On Feb 26, 2015, at 7:43 AM, Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net> wrote:

| don't think | have any insurance policies in the file
Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 26, 2015, at 7:42 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Hi Hans,

Please arrange for a copy of both the McGuire and Gagnon homeowner insurance policies be available for me to pick up by
noon today.

I will pay for copy fees when | pick them up.

Thank you,

Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad
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