
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Case files

Date: December 27, 2016 2:12:58 PM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Date: July 20, 2015 at 7:53:09 AM CDT
To: "<brad@balkelaw.com>" <brad@balkelaw.com>
Subject: Re: Case files

Thanks for the reply.
I will need a check for the money Hans Mast sent you regarding the McGuires insurance.
Paul

On Jul 20, 2015, at 7:24 AM, Brad Balke <brad@balkelaw.com> wrote:

Paul,
	
  
I	
  never	
  created	
  an	
  electronic	
  file.	
  I	
  didn’t	
  need	
  to.	
  I	
  gave	
  you	
  everything	
  I	
  had-­‐I	
  don’t	
  have	
  anything	
  else.
	
  
Anything	
  that	
  is	
  incomplete	
  is	
  the	
  way	
  I	
  got	
  it.
	
  
Sorry	
  I	
  couldn’t	
  do	
  more.
	
  
Brad
	
  
From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Saturday, July 18, 2015 9:51 AM
To: Brad J Balke
Subject: Re: Case files
 
Morning Brad,
Any chance I could get the electronic file anytime soon?
In the Paper file I received It appears that it is incomplete, sections of the depositions are missing as well as
all the Dr's depositions.
Makes me wonder what else isn't included.
Any chance you have the complete file?
Thanks,
Paul

On Jul 16, 2015, at 1:02 PM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Picked up the paper file...
What about the electronic file?

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad

On Jul 15, 2015, at 7:38 AM, Brad J Balke <brad@balkelaw.com> wrote:
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The	
  case	
  file	
  will	
  be	
  available	
  at	
  Donahue's	
  office	
  after	
  1pm	
  today.
	
  
	
  
From: Paul Dulberg
Sent: Tuesday, July 14, 2015 1:56 PM
To: Brad Balke
Subject: Re: Case files
 
Hi Brad,
Just another reminder that I need the case file.
Paul

> On Jul 13, 2015, at 10:45 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:
> 
> Hi Brad,
> When and where can I get both the electronic file and regular file?
> Thanks,
> Paul
> 
> Paul Dulberg
> 847-497-4250
> Sent from my iPad
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