
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Lean expired dynamic hand therapy

Date: December 27, 2016 6:58:52 PM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Date: October 2, 2014 at 9:46:27 AM CDT
To: Hans Mast <hansmast@comcast.net>
Subject: Re: Lean expired dynamic hand therapy

Sorry, They just called me this morning so there is no copy.

Paul

On Oct 2, 2014, at 9:43 AM, Hans Mast <hansmast@comcast.net> wrote:

Paul I'm going to try to Settle your case. No guarantees. But until the case could settle there's nothing I can do about the
balances. Can you give me a copy of that bill.

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 2, 2014, at 9:19 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Hans,

Apparently Dynamic Hand Therapy has a lean that expired. 
It's for $23,900.00 and they said they will give me a 30% discount if I pay within the next few days or they could take me to trial
over it.

Colleen with their corporate office said she contacted you on Aug. 6th about this.

Her number is 815-986-1564

Please advise,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad
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