From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: check from McGuire portion of settlement minus atty fee- $3,333.33
Date: December 27, 2016 4:24:57 PM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>

Date: April 29, 2015 at 10:12:44 AM CDT

To: "<brad@balkelaw.com>" <brad @balkelaw.com>

Subject: Re: check from McGuire portion of settlement minus atty fee- $3,333.33

Morning Brad,

You have power of attorney to endorse the draft on my behalf.

Paul

Ps. Wish | could make Hans choke on this check for his lies/incompetence that lead to such a small amount!
Paul Dulberg

847-497-4250

Sent from my iPad

On Apr 29, 2015, at 9:52 AM, Brad Balke <brad@balkelaw.com> wrote:

Paul,

As discussed, Mast gave me a check for $3,333.33 along with the file. See PDF attached. | need to deposit this in
my IOLTA before the check expires.

To that end, Send me a one-line e-mail stating that | have Power of Attorney to endorse the draft on your behalf.
The funds will just sit there until we resolve the rest of the case.
I’'m going to call Perry Accardo again on the settlement conference. He has to call me back.

Brad
<check $5k from McGuire DULBERG.pdf>
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