
From: Julia WIlliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Subject: Fwd: dulberg

Date: February 10, 2020 at 3:10 PM
To: Paul Dulberg paul_dulberg@comcast.net, Ed Clinton ed@clintonlaw.net, Mary Winch marywinch@clintonlaw.net

Paul, 

Email #4  from Joe Olsen

Julia Williams
Of Counsel
The Clinton Law Firm
111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515
F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender 
immediately. 

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: dulberg
Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:06:29 PM CST
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved!  Our new address is noted above.  Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain  the same.  Thank  
you.

---------- Original Message ---------- 
From: Randy Baudin II <randybaudin2@gmail.com> 
To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net> 
Date: December 20, 2016 at 12:40 PM 
Subject: dulberg 

Attached is the release on Mr. Dulberg's case.  Please sign and initial the edited address portion of the release.  Please return it 
via email or fax at your earliest oppurtunity as the adjuster is heading outing of town Thursday.

If you have any questions please call.

Randy

 W. Randal Baudin II's Linkedin Profile
                           Cell 815.814.2193 

  

 

Dulburg Release 
edit.pdf
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FDTFDDDAFAATFTTAFADFTDATFDDDFDTFDTADTDFFDADDTTFAADADDTTTFTTFAFATT 
The Baudin Law Group  

PO BOX 1678 

CRYSTAL LAKE IL 600391678 

 

 

 

%%DPS::PAE 

%%DPS::PRIMARY 
FADAFDDATA TADFAADDD FTDT FDAFFTDT FDDTADDDAATATA FFTDFAA FFAFDD FFDTDAF  P.O. Box 5720 Woodridge IL 605170720 UNITED STATE S 0245281968 SKO  Ch icago Sou th  

December 14, 2016 

 

INSURED:  DAVID GAGNON PHONE NUMBER:  888-237-4154 

DATE OF LOSS:  June 28, 2011 FAX NUMBER:  866-655-9671 

CLAIM NUMBER:  0245281968 SKO OFFICE HOURS:  Mon - Fri 8:00 am - 6:30 pm, 

Sat 8:00 am - 4:30 pm 

YOUR CLIENT:    PAUL DULBERG 

 

 

Dear The Baudin Law Group,:PFS 

 

I am pleased that we have been able to settle this claim in an amicable manner.  You will find enclosed the release agreement 

for your client's signature. 

 

Please return a signed original of the enclosed release to my attention. 

 

If a lawsuit had been filed, please forward a properly executed request for dismissal with prejudice directly to the attorney 

representing our insured. 

 

Please call me at the number below and refer to our claim number if you wish to discuss any aspect of this case, including 

this letter. 

 

Sincerely, %%DPS ::P FE 

 

KAREN O NEIL  
KAREN O NEIL 

888-237-4154 Ext. 9726754  

Allstate Property and Casualty Insurance Company 

 
   

 

Chicago South 

P.O. BOX 5720 

WOODRIDGE IL 605170720 

 

 

CP3R011 
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%%DPS::DUPLEXRELEASE OF ALL CLAIMS  

CLAIM #  0245281968 
                                                                                                                                                                 

 
This Indenture Witnesseth that, in consideration of the sum of Three Hundred Thousand dollars ($300,000.00), 

receipt whereof is hereby acknowledged, for myself and for my heirs, personal representatives and assigns, I do 

hereby release and forever discharge David and Pam Gagnon and Allstate Insurance Company and any other 

person, firm or corporation charged or chargeable with responsibility or liability, their heirs, representatives and 

assigns, from any and all claims, demands, damages, costs, expenses, loss of services, actions and causes of 

action, arising from any act or occurrence up to the present time and particularly on account of all personal injury, 

disability, property damages, loss or damages of any kind already sustained or that I may hereafter sustain in 

consequence of an accident that occurred on or about the 28th day of June, 2011, at or near 39010 90TH PLACE, 

GENOA CITY , WI. 

 

To procure payment of the said sum, I hereby declare: that I am more than 18 years of age; that no representations 

about the nature and extent of said injuries, disabilities or damages made by any physician, attorney or agent of 

any party hereby release, nor any representations regarding the nature and extent of legal liability or financial 

responsibility of any of the parties release, have induced me to make this settlement; that in determining said sum 

there has been taken into consideration not only the ascertained injuries, disabilities and damages, but also the 

possibility that the injuries sustained may be permanent and progressive and recovery therefrom uncertain and 

indefinite, so that consequences not now anticipated may result from the said accident. 

 

I hereby agree that, as a further consideration and inducement for this compromise settlement, that it shall apply 

to all unknown and unanticipated injuries and damages resulting from said accident, casualty or event, as well as 

to those now disclosed. 

 

I further understand that as I admit no liability of any sort by reason of said accident and that said payments and 

settlements in compromise is made to terminate further controversy respecting all claims for damages that I have 

heretofore asserted or that I or my personal representatives might hereafter assert because of said accident. 

 

I further understand that as I may or shall have incurred, directly or indirectly, in connection with or for damages 

arising out of the accident to each person or organization, release and discharge of liability herein, and to any 

other person or organization, is expressly reserved to each of them, such liability not being waived, agreed upon, 

discharged nor settled by the release. 

 

The undersigned expressly covenants and warrants that all Medicare, Medicaid, hospital, medical provider, health 

care provider, medical supplier and other medical liens, subrogation rights, rights of payment, rights of 

reimbursement and claims of any nature whatsoever, arising now or in the future, as a result of health care 

services provided to the undersigned have been or will be satisfied, settled, compromised or paid by express 

agreement with Medicare, Medicaid, each insurance carrier and each hospital, health care provider, medical 

provider or medical supplier by the undersigned prior to final disbursement of the settlement proceeds.  The 

undersigned covenants and warrants that all such claims, liens, payment obligations and assignments have been 

disclosed in writing to the parties released prior to settlement.  The undersigned agrees to indemnify, defend and 

hold harmless the parties released for any and all losses, claims, demands or causes of action, and any damages, 

judgments, fees, expenses, costs (including interest) of any nature whatsoever paid and incurred as a result of any 

breach of these warranties and covenants.  The undersigned understands and agrees that the parties released have 

relied on these material representations as part of the consideration and inducement for this settlement. 

 

The undersigned understands and agrees that such liability as he/she may or shall have incurred, arising now or in 

the future, as a result of health care services provided to the undersigned, including any health care lien, statutory 

or otherwise, is expressly reserved to each and every health care provider or payor based on such services, such 

liability not being in any way waived, agreed upon, discharged, released or settled or impacted in anyway, by this 

release.  This specifically includes, but is not limited to, any liability the undersigned may have to any hospital, 
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health care provider, medical provider, medical supplier, Medicare or Medicaid.  If any subrogation claims, liens 

or rights to payment of any kind against these settlement proceeds do in fact exist, the undersigned shall distribute 

these funds in accord with such claims, liens or rights to payment (or shall direct his/her attorney to do so).  The 

undersigned agrees to indemnify, defend and hold harmless the parties released for any and all losses, claims, 

demands or causes of action, and any damages, judgments, fees, expenses, costs (including interest) of any nature 

whatsoever paid and incurred as a result of any breach of these agreements and covenants.  The undersigned 

understands and agrees that the parties released have relied on these material representations as part of the 

consideration and inducement for this settlement. 
 

 

(CAUTION-READ BEFORE SIGNING) 
 
 
SIGNED AND SEALED THIS_________________ DAY OF ____________________,  ___________ 
 
 
__________________________________________________(Seal) 

                                                           Signature 

 

__________________________________________________(Seal) 

                                                          Name printed 
 
 
Witnessed by: 
__________________________________  _____________________________________ 
 
__________________________________   _____________________________________ 
 
STATE OF     

COUNTY OF   
 
On this _______________day of ___________________, ____________, before me personally appeared  
 
______________________________, to me known to be the persons ________ who executed the foregoing  
 
instrument, and acknowledged that they  _________ executed the same as their _____free act and deed. 
 
My commission expires _____________________         ______________________________________ 

                                                                                                                                       Notary Public 
 

GENF009 

 


