
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Lean buyout

Date: December 27, 2016 2:30:21 PM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Date: July 9, 2015 at 1:27:45 PM CDT
To: Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net>
Subject: Re: Lean buyout

I was informed all your entitled to is $1539.32 from Brad because you signed off completely on the lean and he already paid you for
the rest.
Is this true?

On Jul 8, 2015, at 12:31 PM, Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net> wrote:

$5,000

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 8, 2015, at 10:09 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

I can't guess...
I want to make sure your paid for your out of pocket expenses plus something for putting up with me. I'm sure I wasn't the
easiest to deal with.
Just give me a number

On Jul 8, 2015, at 11:25 AM, Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net> wrote:

If your calculating our time it'd be a lot. But just give me what you can do.  

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 8, 2015, at 7:44 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Morning Hans,
As I'm not sure how much you invested, I'm not sure what's reasonable.
What would you consider reasonable?
Paul

On Jul 8, 2015, at 6:59 AM, Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net> wrote:

Just make me a reasonable offer. We're happy to work with u

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 7, 2015, at 2:30 PM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

I need to know how much it's going to cost to get the lean released 

On Jul 7, 2015, at 3:57 PM, Hans Mast <hansmast@att.net> wrote:

Whatever you need Paul.  What is your thinking. 

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 7, 2015, at 9:39 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Hi Hans,
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I need to know if your willing to take a cash payout to release your lean on my case?
If so, how much do you want?

Hope life has been good,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad


